Freedom of Information - Humberside Fire and Rescue Service (HFRS)
2024-25/019 –  Wildfires
 
The request is:
I am writing to request data under the Freedom of Information Act regarding information on wildfires that occurred in July of 2022 in this FRS district. I could not find enough information on the data portal to be able to distinguish wildfires. Specifically, I am interested in obtaining the following information for the period of July 2022: 
1. Location (coordinates) and timing (date and time of day) of the wildfires. 
2. Fire size – ideally fire perimeters. 
3. Number of resources deployed. 
4. Fuel type burned (if available). 
5. Impact (e.g. buildings/houses affected, personal injuries, infrastructure, fire service equipment, traffic delays, any evacuations, etc). 
6. If/when a major incident was declared. 

The response is:
We do not record the category ‘wildfire’ in our incident recording system however, as part of our duty to advise and assist we have provided details of all incidents which may fall under the NOG definition of a wildfire (large uncontrolled fires occurring in the open in natural vegetation) and which have been recorded as “grassland, woodlands and crops” for the time period specified. 


The amount of damage in square meters was recorded on our incident recording system prior to April 2022 however was not recorded against any incidents in July 2022. The “on scene” and “return time” is recorded which will indicate how large the fire was and may assist you in assessing whether you wish to consider the incident a “wildfire”.
The only incident which may be of note is Incident no. 016506 (Row 277):
Location (coordinates) and timing (date and time of day) of the wildfires. x 504781,18 y 426144,18 - Opposite Arco/A63 Westbound, Brighton Street to Hessle , Kingston Upon Hull 
Date: 23/07/2022 Time: 20:16 - Re-visits were made on subsequent days to deal with hotspots re-igniting.
2. Fire size – ideally fire perimeters – 40m
3. Number of resources deployed – 6 plus drone
4. Fuel type burned (if available) – Woodland and scrubland
5. Impact (e.g. buildings/houses affected, personal injuries, infrastructure, fire service equipment, traffic delays, any evacuations, etc) - A63 closed temporarily at 20:55
6. If/when a major incident was declared. N/A
We do not believe that any of these incidents will fall within your definition of a wildfire however, please let us know if you require any further information about any other of the incidents listed.

If you are unhappy with the handling of your request, you have the right to ask for an internal review. A request for an internal review should be made within 40 working days of the date of this email. If you are not happy with the outcome of the internal review, you have the right to apply direct to the Information Commissioner. The address is: Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire SK9 5AF.
https://ico.org.uk/
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